Updated details below

Thanks & Regards,
Suresh Kumar


On Sun, Feb 27, 2022 at 2:01 PM Hema - Gtaxfile <hema@gtaxfile.com> wrote:
Dear  Suresh kumar garlapati     ,
Thanks for making the payment, we request you to Pls. give us your Consent to E- File your taxes. let us know if any changes are their before we file the returns.
Pls. cross check your bank details, if you have not provided pls. share them with us to get direct deposit of Refund amount.
 
	Bank Name
	 Bank of America

	Routing Number (Paper/Electronic)
	 081904808

	Account Number
	 002913700589

	Checking / Saving Account
	 Checking

	Account Holder
	 Suresh Kumar Garlapati


 
Pls. provide the below details to E - File your taxes with IRS and state departments.
 
1. If Filing status is Single, provide only your ID proof
1. If Filing Jointly, provide you and your Spouse ID proof
 
	Driving License/ State issued photo ID
	Taxpayer
	Spouse

	Number
	 47594135
	 T4189036

	Issued State
	 TX
	 Andhra Pradesh, India

	Issued Date
	 Jan 26, 2022
	  June 20, 2019

	Expiration date
	 July 26, 2023
	 June 19, 2029

	Type of ID (Driving License / State issued ID)
	 Driving license
	 Passport

	India Home mortigage real address/Indian parents address
	 25-18-116, 1st lane, parvathipuram, sampath nagar, guntur 522004
	 


 

