Hello Hema,

Please do find the details below.

Let me know  if you need more information.

Thanks & Regards,
Priyatham Reddy Kommareddy.


On Mon, Jan 17, 2022 at 10:19 AM Hema - Gtaxfile <hema@gtaxfile.com> wrote:
Dear  Priyatham reddy kommareddy,
Thanks for making the payment, we request you to Pls. give us your Consent to E- File your taxes. let us know if any changes are their before we file the returns.
Pls. cross check your bank details, if you have not provided pls. share them with us to get direct deposit of Refund amount.
 
	Bank Name
	 CHASE

	Routing Number (Paper/Electronic)
	 267084131

	Account Number
	 792193802

	Checking / Saving Account
	 CHECKING

	Account Holder
	 PRIYATHAM REDDY KOMMAREDDY


 
Pls. provide the below details to E - File your taxes with IRS and state departments.
 
1. If Filing status is Single, provide only your ID proof
1. If Filing Jointly, provide you and your Spouse ID proof
 
	Driving License/ State issued photo ID
	Taxpayer
	Spouse

	Number
	 K563-6609-3221
	 

	Issued State
	 ILLINOIS 
	 

	Issued Date
	 06/20/2020
	 

	Expiration date
	 07/23/2022
	 

	Type of ID (Driving License / State issued ID)
	 DRIVING LICENSE
	 

	India Home mortigage real address/Indian parents address
	 6-108, DURGA ESTATES,DEEPTHISRINAGR COLONY, MADINAGUDA,HYDERABAD,500049
	 


 
Pls. Refer your friends and colleagues to utilize our services to file their taxes with IRS respectively.
 
Note: 
1. For All E-Filing Cases, Refund will be credited within 21 days in bank account.
2. For All Paper Filing case, it will take 4 – 8 week's to get Refund and ITIN from IRS.
 
Let us know if you have any question, where we can help you out.
  Refer Your Friends/Colleagues & Get $10 Per Referral...
 
Please feel free to reach us on the below coordinates for more information on our above services. Also, we will be pleased to serve your referrals and honor with $10 per paid client.
 
Thanks in advance for your business and referrals,
Hema,
SR.TEAM LEADER
Phone: 3165404109(whats up number & calls ), DESK NUMBER: 470-480-1881( SRUTHI ) MY TEAM EXECUTIVE
Email:   hema@gtaxfile.com
Website: www.gtaxfile.com
 
 
 
 

