Hi hema,

Please find the details below.

Thanks and regards,
Anusha

On Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 3:43 PM Hema - Gtaxfile <hema@gtaxfile.com> wrote:
 
 
Dear  Anusha moturu  ,
Thanks for making the payment, we request you to Pls. give us your Consent to E- File your taxes. let us know if any changes are their before we file the returns.
Pls. cross check your bank details, if you have not provided pls. share them with us to get direct deposit of Refund amount.
 
	Bank Name
	 Chase bank 

	Routing Number (Paper/Electronic)
	
044000037

	Account Number
	  793628517

	Checking / Saving Account
	 Checking 

	Account Holder
	 Anusha moturu


 USA COMMUNICATION ADDRESS :
 
	Driving License/ State issued photo ID
	Taxpayer
	Spouse

	Number
	 171B233007
	 

	Issued State
	 Missouri
	 

	Issued Date
	 08/20/2020
	 

	Expiration date
	 09/30/2023
	 

	Type of ID (Driving License / State issued ID)
	 State id
	 

	India Home mortigage real address/Indian parents address
	 M.jagan,8-84/2,gokul dham colony, purchotapuram,visakhapatnam,AP,531173
	 


Pls. Refer your friends and colleagues to utilize our services to file their taxes with IRS respectively.
 

