HI HEMA,
PLEASE FIND THE DETAILS BELOW.
NEC OR 1099S OR 1099 MISCELLANEOUS OR SHARES LIKE ROBINHOOD OR COINBASE: NO
IRS INTEREST LATE REFUND: NO
ELECTRONIC CAR: NO
TRADITIONAL IRA CONTRIBUTION 6000$: NO
HEALTH INSURANCE OUTSIDE: NO WE HAVE EMPLOYERS PROVIDED.
RECEIVE 3RD STIMULUS PAYMENT 1400$: NO
JAN TO DEC IN WHICH STATE YOU HAVE STAYED?: 
JAN TO DEC ADDRESSES:
2405 MARYLAND ROAD, UNIT 322, WILLOW GROVE, PA, 19090
DATE: JANUARY 2021 TO JULY 24, 2021

5050 FM 423, APT 9113, FRISCO, TEXAS, 75036
JULY 24, 2021 TO JANUARY 24, 2022.

CURRENT ADDRESS: 515 PROMENADE PKWY, APT # 146, IRVING, TEXAS, 75039. 
FROM JANUARY 24 TO PRESENT. 

MONEY RECEIVED FROM IRS:

	JUL 15, 2021
	IRS TREAS 310 CHILDCTC PPD ID: 9111736959
	ACH CREDIT
	$253.00



	AUG 13, 2021
	IRS TREAS 310 CHILDCTC PPD ID: 9111736959
	ACH CREDIT
	$249.00



	SEP 15, 2021
	IRS TREAS 310 CHILDCTC PPD ID: 9111736946
	ACH CREDIT
	$250.00


 
	OCT 15, 2021
	IRS TREAS 310 CHILDCTC PPD ID: 9111736959
	ACH CREDIT
	$249.00



	NOV 15, 2021
	IRS TREAS 310 CHILDCTC PPD ID: 9111736043
	ACH CREDIT
	$250.00



	DEC 15, 2021
	IRS TREAS 310 CHILDCTC PPD ID: 9111736959
	ACH CREDIT
	$249.00



REGARDS,
CHANDRAKANTH MULLELLA. 




ON TUE, FEB 8, 2022 AT 4:58 PM CHANDRAKANTH MULLELLA <CHANDOO1986@GMAIL.COM> WROTE:
HI HEMA,

ATTACHED TO THIS EMAIL PLEASE FIND THE W2 OF MY WIFE. I WAS UNEMPLOYED FOR THE YEAR 2021 AND STARTED WORKING ON DECEMBER 1 AFTER MY H1B REINSTATED. PLEASE FIND OUR FAMILY DETAILS BELOW. 

CHANDRAKANTH MULLELLA
DURGA LAKSHMI NEELAPALA
LOUKHYA MULLELLA

PLEASE LET ME KNOW IF ANYTHING ELSE IS REQUIRED FROM MY END. THANK YOU. 

REGARDS,
CHANDRAKANTH MULLELLA. 

