Dear Hema,

Please find my details updated in the below email.
can you please share once the final copy of the tax calculation?

Best Regards,
Dattatray Jadhav


On Thu, Apr 14, 2022 at 7:31 PM Hema - Gtaxfile <hema@gtaxfile.com> wrote:
 
 
Dear DATTA       ,
Thanks for making the payment, we request you to Pls. give us your Consent to E- File your taxes. let us know if any changes are their before we file the returns.
Pls. cross check your bank details, if you have not provided pls. share them with us to get direct deposit of Refund amount.
 
	Bank Name
	 Digital Federal Credit Union

	Routing Number (Paper/Electronic)
	 211 391 825

	Account Number
	 42444075

	Checking / Saving Account
	 Checking

	Account Holder
	 Dattatray D Jadhav


 
Pls. provide the below details to E - File your taxes with IRS and state departments.
 
1. If Filing status is Single, provide only your ID proof - 
1. If Filing Jointly, provide you and your Spouse ID proof -  Giving DL ID details for Dattatray Jadhav, Spouse doesn't have DL and her state ID is expired.
 
	Driving License/ State issued photo ID
	Taxpayer
	Spouse

	Number
	 UV875574
	 

	Issued State
	 Ohio
	 

	Issued Date
	 12/18/2021
	 

	Expiration date
	 10/30/2022
	 

	Type of ID (Driving License / State issued ID)
	 Driving License
	 

	India Home mortigage real address/Indian parents address
	 S No-50/3B, Nakshatra Apt, Flat-B-11, VivekNagar Akurdi, Pune, Maharashtra, 411035, INDIA
	 


 

