Amar - Gtaxfile

To: Sruthi
Subject: RE: IDS

From: Sruthi [mailto:sruthi@gtaxfile.com]
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2022 2:12 AM
To: amar@gtaxfile.com

Subject: FW: IDS

From: AMEYA CHILWAR [mailto:ameyachilwar@gmail.com]
Sent: 13 March 2022 07:24

To: Sravani - Gtaxfile; hema@gtaxfile.com; sruthi@gtaxfile.com
Subject: Re: IDS

Hello Team,

Pls find my bank details below:

Bank Name Chase

Routing Number (Paper/Electronic) 111000614

Account Number 312352799

Checking / Saving Account Checking

Account Holder Ameya Satish Chilwar

Please provide the below details to E - File your taxes with IRS and state departments.

1. If Filing status is Single, provide only your ID proof

Driving License/ State issued photo ID Taxpayer
Number 44677079
Issued State Texas

Issued Date 11/08/2021




Expiration date 10/18/2023

Type of ID (Driving License / State issued Driving License
ID)

Last year (TY2018) Adjusted gross income

Thanks in Advance!!!

Kind Regards,
Ameya Chilwar
+16822564523

On Tue, Mar 8, 2022 at 1:56 PM Sravani - Gtaxfile <sravani@gtaxfile.com> wrote:

DEAR AMEYACHILWAR,

Thanks for making the payment,

Please cross check your bank details, if you have not provided please share them with us to get direct deposit
of Refund amount.

Bank Name

Routing Number (Paper/Electronic)

Account Number

Checking / Saving Account

Account Holder

Please provide the below details to E - File your taxes with IRS and state departments.
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1. If Filing status is Single, provide only your ID proof
2. If Filing Jointly, provide you and your Spouse ID proof

Driving License/ State issued photo ID Taxpayer Spouse

Number

Issued State

Issued Date

Expiration date

Type of ID (Driving License / State issued ID)

Last year (TY2018) Adjusted gross income

Thanks in Advance!!!

Regards,

sravani

Client Relationship Executive
Phone: +1 646-680-0116
whatsapp no :+1770-449-2083

Email: sravani@gtaxfile.com

Website: www.gataxfile.com







