HELLO HEMA,

PLEASE SEE SCANNED COPIES OF MY WIFE'S PASSPORT ATTACHED TO THIS EMAIL.

THANKS,
RUTWHIJ 

ON THU, MAR 16, 2023 AT 9:03 PM RUTWHIJ SHUKLA <RUTWHIJ@GMAIL.COM> WROTE:
HELLO HEMA,

I HAVE UPDATED THE REQUESTED INFORMATION IN THE BELOW EMAIL.

MY ADDRESS FOR THE NEXT 12 MONTHS WILL BE: 2140 SUMMIT RIDGE LOOP, MORRISVILLE, NC, 27560 
I HAVE ALSO ENCLOSED MY TEMPORARY LICENSE FROM NC DMV AS I AM YET TO RECEIVE A PERMANENT ONE ALONG WITH MY OLD LICENSE WITH MY OLD ADDRESS JUST FOR YOUR REFERENCE.
FINALLY, MY WIFE'S PASSPORT SCAN COPY IS ATTACHED. I WILL GET ANOTHER COPY FROM HER IF THIS IS NOT MEETING THE REQUIREMENTS.

THANKS,
RUTWHIJ 

ON THU, MAR 16, 2023 AT 3:56 PM HEMA - GTAXFILE <HEMA@GTAXFILE.COM> WROTE:
 
DEAR RUTWHIJ   ,
THANKS FOR MAKING THE PAYMENT, WE REQUEST YOU TO PLS. GIVE US YOUR CONSENT TO E- FILE YOUR TAXES. LET US KNOW IF ANY CHANGES ARE THEIR BEFORE WE FILE THE RETURNS.
PLS. CROSS CHECK YOUR BANK DETAILS, IF YOU HAVE NOT PROVIDED PLS. SHARE THEM WITH US TO GET DIRECT DEPOSIT OF REFUND AMOUNT.
USA COMMUNICATION ADDRESS   FOR NEXT 6 MONTHS 
 
 BANK DETAILS 
	BANK NAME
	 WELLS FARGO 

	ROUTING NUMBER (PAPER/ELECTRONIC)
	[image: IMG_1270.jpg]

	ACCOUNT NUMBER
	 9232220419

	CHECKING / SAVING ACCOUNT
	 CHECKING ACCOUNT

	ACCOUNT HOLDER
	 RUTWHIJ H SHUKLA


 
	DRIVING LICENSE/ STATE ISSUED PHOTO ID
	TAXPAYER
	SPOUSE

	NUMBER
	 000040852510
	  N/A

	ISSUED STATE
	NORTH CAROLINA
	  N/A

	ISSUED DATE
	 03/09/2023
	  N/A

	EXPIRATION DATE
	 05/08/2023
	  N/A

	TYPE OF ID (DRIVING LICENSE / STATE ISSUED ID)
	 DRIVING LICENSE
	  N/A

	INDIAN ADDRESS:
	 B-202, MEGHAVARSHA HOUSING SOCIETY, NR SHELL PETROL PUMP, WARJE, PUNE-411052
	  2756, VARDHAMAN SANKUL APARTMENT, MANGALVAR PETH, KOLHAPUR, PIN-416102
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Account number 9232220419
Routing numbers

Direct deposit & electronic payments 111900659

Domestic wire transfers 121000248




